
Brett Bieder aka Whargoul
Northern IL Assembly Rep

Due to lack of reaching or maintaining quorum on multiple occasions and the
business of the organization has been hindered by it many times , the bylaws
section that reads

SECTION THREE: PARLIAMENTARY ORDER

Subsection One: Quorum

A quorum necessary to conduct business of the Assembly at a regularly
scheduled meeting shall be a simple majority of its members. Vacant seats
shall not count toward the number of Representatives necessary for quorum
unless this would reduce quorum to less than one third (1/3) of its seats, in
which case a quorum shall be at least one third (1/3) of its seats. This quorum
shall be sufficient to conduct business of the Assembly, and any quotient of
Representatives required to pass a measure shall be based on this quorum. A
quorum necessary to conduct business of the Assembly at an emergency
meeting called in accordance with Subsection Three of this Section shall be
one third (1/3) of its members. This quorum shall be sufficient to conduct
business of the Assembly with the exception of amending these Bylaws, and
any quotient of Representatives required to pass a measure shall be based on
this quorum.

This quorum shall be accomplished by roll call via voice or physical
participation in a meeting.

Shall be changed to :

SECTION THREE: PARLIAMENTARY ORDER

Subsection One: Quorum

A quorum necessary to conduct business of the Assembly at a regularly
scheduled meeting shall be a simple majority of its elected and appointed
members. Vacant seats shall not count toward the number of Representatives
necessary for quorum. This quorum shall be sufficient to conduct business of
the Assembly, and any quotient of Representatives required to pass a measure
shall be based on this quorum. A quorum necessary to conduct business of
the Assembly at an emergency meeting called in accordance with Subsection
Three of this Section shall be one third (1/3) of its elected or appointed
members. This quorum shall be sufficient to conduct business of the Assembly



and any quotient of Representatives required to pass a measure shall be
based on this quorum.

This quorum shall be accomplished by roll call via voice or electronic check in
at a meeting.


